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Give Dad Some Torque and Finesse with 
Snap-on’s Father’s Day Special 

 
Get Two Versatile Snap-on Screwdrivers in One Great Kit 

 
KENOSHA, Wis. – June 3, 2010 – Give Dad power and performance, and maybe a little finesse this 
Father’s Day with Snap-on’s CTS561CLSK screwdriver kit. The versatile kit contains the popular 
Snap-on cordless screwdriver along with a Snap-on ratcheting screwdriver, plus shanks and bits 
added in for good measure.   
 
“The CTS561CLSK is a terrific gift for Dad,” said Rodger Isetts, product manager for Snap-on.  “We 
took our standard cordless screwdriver and modified the gear box to accept the same shanks that are 
used with our Snap-on ratcheting screwdriver.  Then, we combined it with our ratcheting screwdriver, 
shanks and bits to create a very special Father’s Day kit.  The end user now has the option to use the 
power tool when he needs more torque or use the ratcheting screwdriver when the application calls 
for more finesse, such as working on non-marking surfaces like stainless steel.” 
 
The CTS561CLSK kit contains a Snap-on cordless screwdriver and battery recharger plus a Snap-on 
ratcheting screwdriver, bits and shanks, and it comes with a handy and sturdy carrying case. The 
special CTS561CLSK is available only from participating Snap-on franchisees and quantities are 
limited. To find out more information, visit www.snapon.com or contact your Snap-on franchisee. 
 
About Snap-on Tools 
Snap-on Tools is a subsidiary of Snap-on Incorporated, a leading global innovator, manufacturer and 
marketer of tools, diagnostics and equipment solutions for professional users. Product lines include 
hand and power tools, tool storage, diagnostics software, information and management systems, 
shop equipment and other solutions which are used by technicians and professionals at vehicle 
dealerships and repair centers and in the marine, powersports and aviation industries.  Snap-on Tools 
is one of the largest non-food franchise companies in the world, selling its products through more than 
4,500 franchisees worldwide and through company-direct sales and over the Internet. Snap-on 
Incorporated, which was founded in 1920, is a $2.4 billion, S&P 500 company located in Kenosha, 
Wis. with operations throughout the world.  For additional information, visit www.snapon.com.        
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