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Snap-on Non-Marring Scraper Set Handles 
Tough Jobs, But Won’t Hurt Soft Surfaces 

 
KENOSHA, Wis. – December 2, 2008 – Snap-on’s new five-piece, non-marring scraper set 
(PKN500) includes everything professional technicians, body shops and detailers need to safely 
remove adhesive, foam, moldings and emblems off of interior automotive surfaces, while eliminating 
the fear of scratching or gouging soft materials. 
 
“Each tool in our new five-piece non-marring scraper set has a different tip to easily handle every 
scraping job that comes into your shop,” said Bryan Hantke, product manager for Snap-on. “With 
curved and angled profiles, they are excellent tools for getting into tight spaces to loosen, clean and 
scrape. With Snap-on, techs have the power and control they need to get the job done right.” 
 
The five-piece, non-marring scraper set from Snap-on includes: 7/8” straight blade tool (PKN1);   
1-1/4” straight blade tool (PKN2); 1-1/8” curved blade tool (PKN3); 3/4” angle blade tool (PKN4); 5/8” 
curved blade tool (PKN5); and a kit bag (CO100). The non-marring scraper set tools are made of 
glass-reinforced nylon for strength, are light weight and resistant to most automotive fluids. Popular 
"at home" applications include caulk, paint, and putty removal. This set is not recommended for use 
on windshields or other glass surfaces.  
 
Customers can find out more about the five-piece, non-marring scraper set by contacting their local 
Snap-on franchisee, visiting www.snapon.com or by calling toll free 877-SNAPON-2 (877-762-7662).  
  
About Snap-on Tools 
Snap-on Tools Company, LLC is a leading global innovator, manufacturer and marketer of tools, 
diagnostics and equipment solutions for professional users. Product lines include hand and power 
tools, tool storage, diagnostics software, information and management systems, shop equipment 
and other solutions which are used by technicians and professionals at vehicle dealerships and 
repair centers and in the marine, powersports and aviation industries.  Snap-on is one of the largest 
non-food franchise companies in the world, selling its products through more than 4,000 franchisees 
worldwide and through company-direct sales and over the Internet. Snap-on Tools is a subsidiary of 
Snap-on Incorporated, which was founded in 1920 and is a $2.8 billion, S&P 500 company 
headquartered in Kenosha, Wis. For additional information on Snap-on, visit www.snapon.com.  
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