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Tool of the Month:  
3/8-inch Drive Fuel Pressure Sensor Socket for GM Vehicles 

 
KENOSHA, Wis. – March 6, 2014 – The removal of the fuel pressure sensors on GM® vehicles can 
be a challenge. Service technicians often attempt to remove them with pliers, which can easily 
damage the part. Utilizing a socket is a much faster and more efficient approach to removing the 
sensors. The new Snap-on® 3/8-inch Drive 27mm 6-point Fuel Pressure Sensor Socket (A227) is the 
perfect time-saving tool for this particular job. 
 
On GM vehicles, access to the fuel sensors is restricted by the sensor connector and side air intake 
ports. The sensors could be damaged easily if the proper tool is not used. The new Snap-on 3/8-inch 
Drive 27mm 6-point Fuel Pressure Sensor Socket (A227) is thin walled and has a special broach 
depth to give service technicians better access to the fuel pressure sensor.  
 
 “Our goal with every Snap-on tool is to find effective ways to increase the productivity and efficiency 
of our customers so jobs don’t take up more of their time than they should,” said Scott Amundson, 
product manager for Snap-on. “Customer feedback we received helped us develop the new A227 
socket. It is specifically designed to help technicians repair fuel pressure sensors on GM vehicles 
more quickly and easily than before.” 
 
The Snap-on 3/8-inch Drive 27mm 6-point Fuel Pressure Sensor Socket (A227) removes GM fuel 
pressure sensors without difficulty on a number of 2007-2011 models, including the Cadillac® CTS® 
and STS®; the Buick® Allure®, Enclave® and LaCrosse®; and the Chevrolet® Camaro®, Cobalt®, HHR®, 
Traverse® and Acadia®.  
 
Customers can find out more about the new Snap-on 3/8-inch Drive 27mm 6-point Fuel Pressure 
Sensor Socket (A227) by contacting their participating Snap-on franchisee or representative or by 
calling toll free 877-SNAPON-4 (877-762-7664). 
 
About Snap-on Tools 
Snap-on Tools is a subsidiary of Snap-on Incorporated, a leading global innovator, manufacturer and 
marketer of tools, equipment, diagnostics, repair information and systems solutions for professional 
users performing critical tasks. Products and services include hand and power tools, tool storage, 
diagnostics software, information and management systems, shop equipment and other solutions for 
vehicle dealerships and repair centers, as well as for customers in industries, including aviation and 
aerospace, agriculture, construction, government and military, mining, natural resources, power 
generation and technical education. Snap-on Tools is one of the largest non-food franchise 
companies in the world, selling its products and services through franchisee, company-direct, 
distributor and Internet channels.  Snap-on Incorporated, which was founded in 1920, is a $3.1 billion, 
S&P 500 company located in Kenosha, Wis. with operations throughout the world.  For additional 
information, visit www.snapon.com.    
 

# # # 

 

mailto:richard.secor@snapon.com
http://store.snapon.com/Non-Catalog-Items-3-8DR-27MM-FUEL-SENSOR-SKT-P9770114.aspx
http://store.snapon.com/Non-Catalog-Items-3-8DR-27MM-FUEL-SENSOR-SKT-P9770114.aspx
http://www.snapon.com/
http://www.facebook.com/SnaponTools


2801 80th Street, Kenosha, WI  53141   phone (262) 656-5200 

 

 

http://twitter.com/

